COPRC Dodo Canyon E-76

VIII. Daily Drilling Reports

4/8/2014 Dodo Canyon E-76 End of Well Report Page 27




Report Date: 12/9/2013

Daily Drilling Report #: 1

Depth Progress: m

o
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB

B Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
- Tuwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -18.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
61,279.66 61,279.66 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00| 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 105.0 1,080.00 1,080.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature {°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -36|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Canol, rig hands, medics and Conoco reps. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents.

Fly Beaver #2 rig personnel, service hands and Conoco reps to Norman Wells from Calgary and Edmonton using Canadian North chartered flight. Set everyone up
with accomodations at the construction camp (on the rack site) and the 2 Hodgsons camp in Norman Wells. Round up transportation for all services, rig hands and
Conoco reps. Held safety orientation meetings in Conoco's office in Norman Wells with all services prior to them comencing work with ConocoPhillips. Could not
cross river until Tuesday morning due to warm weather and construction working on ice bridge. Wait until morning to hold safety meeting prior to crossing river,
warming up equipment, remove snow from all trucks and equipment, set up ratholers and drill conductor.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Canol, rig hands, medics and Conoco reps, cross river, warm up equipment, remove snow from all trucks and equipment, set
up ratholers and drill conductor.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String

|
( e Log
Sl TR , L e
CStart o e S o ) b : g e[ )5 Start Depth End Depth P
- Time - |-.End.Time | Rur.(hr) " ‘Phase 2|1/ Op Code .- | Activity Code | TeX | Trbi Code )i (mKB) {mKB) G i Operation .y il St

00:00 [13:00 13.00 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Fly Beaver #2 rig personnel, service hands and Conoco reps
to Norman Wells from Calgary and Edmonton using Canadian
North chartered flight. Set everyone up with accomodations at
the construction camp (on the rack site) and the 2 Hodgsons
camp in Norman Wells. Round up transportation for all
services, rig hands and Conoco reps. Held safety orientation
meetings in Conoco's office in Norman Wells with all services
prior to them comencing work with ConocoPhillips. Could not
cross river until Tuesday morning due to warm weather and
construction working on ice bridge.

13:00 |00:00 11.00 |[MIRU MOVE wobDL [P 0.00 0.00 jWait until morning to hold safety meeting prior to crossing
river, warming up equipment, remove snow from all trucks
and equipment, set up ratholers and drill conductor.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m°) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m%) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mgiL) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium {mg/L)

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |[Next Check Date

BOP Dirill )

P~vs Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

789.00 789.00
warety Incidents

SO DateT T ] i ey “ : o R SR Com Sy Glnastnl : : -z Category
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Report Date: 12/9/2013

Report #: 1

C e q1H Daily Dri"ing Depth Progress: m

onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB

B Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:

« ..l String: BHA # <BHA No.?>

Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) 1ADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)

Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load {daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

Comment

Drill String Components

“ltem Des 21D (mm) 0D {mm) Jts L:en {m) “Cum,Len{m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|\WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic'Calculations: . 1 i n : i - ; ; .
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [ Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m°)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

(

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
SR Date + Depth (mKB) T T Q-Flow (m*/min). - : P.(kPa)" Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
g e Start Date S End Date i :i"Liner Size (mm) : P:Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR.(m¥/stk)
. 12014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
RN ‘Date :::Depth (mKB) : Q Flow (m3min) =700 P.(kPa) : Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.64 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
SE e Start Date 2R el : . End Date + Liner,Size:(mm) ; P -Max (kPa) = i Vol/Stk OR (i¥/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/12014 127.0
Shaker Screens
: 2 Des i Start Date End:Date -8cr8z X HScrszY: Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1{BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
s Date e S HS (hn) RPM:(rpm).: Dens OF kg/m?) QOF (Lminiy - -~ Dens UE(ka/m¥) = Q UF-(L/min} :
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
=i Date i s (hr) e RPM (rpm)- Dens OF (kg/m?) " QOF (Limin) Dens UF (kg/m%:: T Q UF:(L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 | 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
[ i e : Des Consumed - “Costiz Size" Units
%’urvey Data
: [ Date: s aE ) wi MDmKB) G snel(2) “Azm (%) LTVD {mKB) Depart (m) 5. +NS (M) EW (m) _| VSim).ii DLS (#/30m)
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Report Date: 12/9/2013

» Daily Drilling Report #: 1

ConocoPhillips Depth Progress: m

‘ P COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB

) Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
g Rig:

. .mations
: Formation'Name | Drill Top MD.(imKB) Drill Top (TVD) (mKB) Prog Top. TVD, (mKB)

Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00

Slater River 76.00 76.00 176.00

Arcﬁc Red 800.50 800.46 76.40

Martin.House 938.50| 938.44 | 76.40

Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40

Upper Canol 1,665:00 1,658.53 1,653.40

Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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Report Date: 12/10/2013

> Daily Drilling Dot proport: 2
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
By Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig:
.Auwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB0O1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -17.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
53,459.03 114,738.69 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00] 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 105.0 1,080.00 2,160.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -32|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report . Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to crossing river, warming up equipment and drilling conductor. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 1 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with OK Dirilling, Canol, rig hands, medics and Conoco reps. Cross river, construction working on ice bridge and iceroads to
location, warm up equipment, remove snow from all trucks and equipment, set up ratholers and drill 20" x 20m conductor. Shut down, wait until morning to finish
drilling and cementing the 20" x 20m conductor, drilling mousehole and rathole and then setting up wellsite shacks with generators on E-76 65-10 126-45 location.

24hr Forecast
Finish drilling and cementing the 20" x 20m conductor, drill and set 6 x 3 crib, mousehole and rathole and then move and set up wellsite shacks with generators and
miscellaneous loads on E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Wait until morning to move Beaver #2 rig.

Daily Contacts )
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String

(

Time Log
£ o £ ; o ¥ Tim .
s : ) : eP-|: o Start Depth End-Depth kA
ne."|-End Time | -Dur(hr) Phase Op Cade Activity Code| .T-X| :iTrb| Code (mKB).. (mKB) : Operations =+

00:00 |07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE woDL [P 0.00 0.00 { Wait until morning.

07:00 [07:15 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Canol, rig hands,
medics and Conoco reps.

07:15 |21:00 13.75|MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Cross river, construction working on ice bridge and iceroads
to location, warm up equipment, remove snow from all trucks
and equipment, set up ratholers and drill 20" x 20m
conductor.

21:00 |00:00 3.00 |MIRU MOVE woDL |P 0.00 0.00 [ Shut down, wait until morning to finish drilling and cementing
the 20" x 20m conductor, drilling mousehole and rathole and
then setting up wellsite shacks with generators on E-76 65-10
126-45 location.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (ka/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-ss) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) : Cumulative Mud Cost {Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... [Next Check Date

BOP Drill

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident {(days)

790.00 790.00

Safety Incidents

s -Date : s e +.0om . p o e G Category
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Report Date: 12/10/2013

Report #: 2

c Ph'“' Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: m
onocobhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKGB
Canada ¥ , Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:

~.ll String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
Drill String Components

=r ltem Des 1D, (mm) QD (mim) Jts CLen(m) cam:Len{m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |[Flow Rate../WOB (daN) [RPM (r... [SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations. gLy PR Pipiiei : : R e I = ‘ . i
Bit Hydraulic Powe...[HP/Area (kW/mm?) [% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m® |ECD End (kg/m?)
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

(

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: : : Date Depth(mKB) B - QiF)ow (m3fmin) P.(kPa) geon|n Strokes (spm) i
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
Vi Start Date End:Date Liner Size:(mm): .2 P.Max (kPa). Vol/Stk OR(m3/stk): -
112014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/12014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm}) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Ra L HeDate o = ‘Depth:(mKB) L Q-Flow (m3/min) P.(kPa) i o) st Strokes (spm) -
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
RN Start Date. T End Date Linef Size(mm) | P:Max (kPa) 3 VoliStk OR:(m®/stk): &
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
el o Des Stari Date 5] i End:Date) Ser.Sz:X Scr Sz, Note -
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i : . “i:Date Hrs (hr) * RPM(rpm) .. Dens OF (kg Q- OF(L/min) Dens UF (kg/m®) :Q:UF{L/min) -
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
©osdn eiDate Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm).: Dens OF (kg/m?) . - QOF (Limin) Dens UF (kg/m?) Q UF(Limin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts _
T L : Des * Consumed Cost ~iSize <. Units
Survey Data
coDates s 1 :MD (mKB) Incl: ()] Azmi(®) TVD (mKB) - Depart (m) NS;(m) EW.{m) VS (m) i) 2-DLS (/30m)::
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/10/2013
Report #: 2

b HIH Dally Dri"ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00miB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
.mations
K ;.7 :Formation Name: Drili Top MD (mKB) " Drill Top (TVD) (mKB) Prog Top.TVD (mKB)’

Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Stater Rver 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin Fouse 938.50 038.44 76.40
imperial 975.50 97543 76.40
Upper Cano 1665,00 1.658.53 1.653.40
| ower Canol 1 ,700.72-| 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 3/3

Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/11/2013

- o Daily Drilling Dot prporL S
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depii En: 0.00mKEB
i Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig:
. TUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -16.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
101,530.46 216,269.15 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 128.0 1,146.00 3,306.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -35|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to moving Beaver #2 rig and drilling mousehole and rathole. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting prior to crossing river, drilling conductor and moving wellsite shacks to location. Construction working on ice bridge and
iceroads to location. Finish drilling the 20" x 20m conductor, drill and set 6' x 3' crib, mousehole and rathole and then move and set up wellsite shacks with generator
on E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Hold safety meeting with Schlumberger cementers, Ok Rathole, Conoco rep, vac and water truck hands. Pump 10tonne/7.5m3 of
Class "G" Arctic blend cement followed by 3.5m3 of fresh water leaving 2m of cement in the conductor to drill out prior to spud. Wait until morning to move Beaver

#2 rig.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, drill mousehole and rathole, move Beaver #2 rig, rental equipment and miscellaneous loads to E-76 65-10 126-45 location.Wait until daylight to

continue moving rig and rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS

Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String

'Conductor, 20.00mKB

e Log

. i Tim s R
<Start-i] ) B> i doiin i Py ! -“Start Depth' | - End'Depth il
Time ¢ 'End Time | - Dur (hr);| - "= -Phase .0p Code ! | Activity Code) TaX( | Trbl Code | =i AmKBY 1 i i (mKB) e S A Operation

00:00 |07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE woDL ([P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.

07:00 |07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting prior to crossing river, drilling conductor
and moving wellsite shacks to location.

07:15 |17:45 10.50 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Construction working on ice bridge and iceroads to location.
Finish drilling the 20" x 20m conductor, drill and set 6' x 3'
crib, mousehole and rathole and then move and set up
wellsite shacks with generators on E-76 65-10 126-45
location.

17:45 |18:00 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with Schlumberger cementers, Ok
Rathole, Conoco rep, vac and water truck hands.

18:00 [21:00 3.00 [MIRU MOVE CMNT P 0.00 0.00 | Pump 10tonne/7.5m3 of Class "G" Arctic blend cement
followed by 3.2m3 of fresh water leaving 3m of cement in the
conductor to drill out prior to spud.

21:00 |00:00 3.00|MIRU MOVE wOoDL (P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning to move Beaver #2 rig.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pass) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

EGCD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m®)

Mud Lost to Hole

(m°)

Daily Mud Field Est

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... [Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
RAOP Drill
; Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

791.00 791.00
Safety Incidents

e ‘Date i Com S Category s E 0

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/11/2013

Report #: 3

C Ph’“' Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progress: m
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE

) Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
g Rig:

.l String: BHA # <BHA No.?>

Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment

Drill String Components

; Item Des 1D (mm) OD (mm) Jts ‘Len (m) Cum Len (m)

Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... {SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...{Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations ; o e e R LlniEl e i sl . s
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m®} |ECD End (kg/m?3)

Drill String Volume (m°)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
L o Date Depth (mKB) - Q Flow (m*min) : P (kPa) i .. Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
! in Start Date e End Date Liner Size {mm) P Maxi(kPa) i Vol/Stk OR {m¥/stk). i =
12014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
2 SR ~Date w224 Depth’ (MKB) o : Q Flow.(m*/min). =3 P:(kPa) - LiStrokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
R Lo Start Date - : Erd Date, Liner.Size-(mm) L P Max (kPa) ] : Vol/Stk OR (m®/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
CaiooDes iStart:Date :End Date .i8erSzaX SeriSz Y. “Noteii
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
o S Date CERrsthn Lo “LRPM (rpm) Déns OF:(kg/m?) : Gt e OR(LMInY )i Dens U (kg/mdy - QUF (Limin) 7
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
EE e Datediiin s v iHrs (hr) et Fre RPM (rpm) i s :Dens OF (kg/m?).: S QOR(LmINY i ‘Dens:UF:(kg/m?) QUFEALmin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
) Ty : Des Consumed Cost Size Units
\aurvey Data
] Date’: MD (KB) Incl %) Azm (%) VD (MKB) Depart () NS {m) £ CEW (m) VS (m) = " DLS (°/30m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/11/2013
Report #: 3

Vh' ) Daily Drilling Dot prporL 2
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKEB
) Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig:
. ..mations
Formation:Name i Dl Top"MD (MKB) Drill Top (TVD) (MKB) Prog Top TVD (mKE)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 938.44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper.Cano| 1,665.00 1,658:53 1,653.40
Lower Cano 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Tempiate Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/12/2013
Report #: 4

» Daily Drilling
‘ HlH Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
) Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
/ Uwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -15.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
58,109.03 274,378.18 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 4,461.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -39|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to moving Beaver #2 rig. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 3 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and Conoco reps. Drill mousehole and rathole, lay down environmental liner,
move and spot Beaver #2 rig matting and some rental equipment to E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Load substructure to be hauled out and spotted first thing in the
morning. Wait until daylight to continue moving rig and rental equipment.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, move and spot Beaver #2 substructure, buildings, rental equipment and miscellaneous loads to E-76 65-10 126-45 location.Wait until daylight
to continue moving and spotting rig and rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
. : S| Tim e bl
art i e LA . : i : Start.Deptti End Depth
ae:] End:Time| iDur.(hr):} -/ Phase Op Cade Activity Codé| T-X'| - Trbl. Code {mKB) A{mKBY: i : L QOperation

'00:00 |07:00 7.00 | MIRU MOVE wobDL [P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.

07:00 |07:15 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 { Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Beaver hands, Canol
Trucking and Conoco reps.

07:15 |20:00 12.75|MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Drill mousehole and rathole, lay down environmental liner,
move and spot Beaver #2 rig matting and some rental
equipment to E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Load substructure
to be hauled out and spotted first thing in the moring.

20:00 |00:00 4.00 | MIRU MOVE woDL |P 0.00 0.00 [ Wait until daylight to continue moving rig and rental
equipment.

Fluid/iMud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline {°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m°)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field

Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
792.00 792.00
Safety Incidents
ShndauiDate 1Com Category
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/12/2013

Report #: 4

C LA Daily Drilling bepth prerorL 4
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
- Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
{ Rig:
- -«il String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run | Drill Bit Length (m) TADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mn?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
Drill String Components

L Gy Item Des 1D {mm) OD (mm) Jts Len(m) =~ . 2 Cum:Len (m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... {Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) [RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations el - ‘ 3 Latt : e G L i
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) {Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m3)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min} |Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

(

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks

B RO Date Depth (mKB) : Q. Flow (m?/min) v P o(kPa) s . Strokes:(spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
s ;Start Date “o s End Date i Liner Size (mm) e P Max (kPa) T 7 VoUSKkOR (mistk)

/2014 1/21/2014 127.0

112212014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
SRR i'Date == Depth (mKB) L s Q Flow (m3min) : P (kPa) il - Strokés:(spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations

o % Start:Date - Hid End Date. Liner Size-(mm) P-Max (kPa) : VoliStk OR (m®/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000

1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens

1 e Des’ ‘- Start Date + End Date Sérgz X sz “Note 41
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)

1/BOS Solutions 5500

Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks

Ty i Date : FHeshn s e RPM(rpm) Dens OF (kg/ni?) :; | QOF:{L/min) :* . .Dens UF:(kg/m?) L QUF(Limin).:
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)

2|BOS Solutions 5500

Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks

cl e Date ] L HrShe L7 "RPM (rpm) Dens OF(kg/m?)’ QOF(Liin) . Dens UF (Kgim®y. i 51Q UF (Umin) .|
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 ©990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts

S G Des (Jiii i Consumed s Cost L. Slze S cUnits

Sarvey Data

: : =Date MD:(KB) £ Incl{%) Azm (D 5] S TVD(MKBY S f EE Depart (m) = NS (m)° SEW (M)l JoNSHm) DLS{(°/30m)

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




V o .
ConocoPhillips
Canada s

Daily Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Rig:

Report Date: 12/12/2013
Report #: 4

Depth Progress: m

Depth End: 0.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

( .mations

Formation Name “:Drill:-Top.MD:(mKB) “Diill Top (TVD){mKB) - -~ Prog Top:TVD (mKB) .
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76:00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 938.44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper:Ganol 1,665.00 1,658:53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 3/3

Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/13/2013
Report #: 5

4 HH Dally DrI"lng Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ ) Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig:
1 UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOBO1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation {m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -14.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
177,910.46 452,288.64 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 5,616.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -29|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to moving Beaver #2 rig. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

2-HID, 0- OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and Conoco reps. Move and attempt to spot Beaver #2 substructure when the cable
wedge (pressed on bell) on main winch line on the big Canol bed truck broke dropping the substructure 2 feet from the ground at 11:00am on Friday, December
13th. Shut down rig moving and construction operations until tomorrow morning. Wait until morning to move and spot rig and rental equipment.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, spot Beaver #2 substructure, buildings, rental equipment and miscellaneous loads to E-76 65-10 126-45 location.Wait until daylight to continue
moving and spotting rig and rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
e . . : B Tim ol : .
At sl e RSt ep-| ! 51 StartDepth | 'End:Depth i :
ie::|-End Time/| iDurhn). | Phdse Op Code | Activity:Code | T-X| - Trbl Code (mKB) (mKB) i Operation

vw:00 [07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE woDL  |P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.

07:00 (07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 |Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and
Conoco reps.

07:15 |[10:45 3.50 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Move and attempt to spot Beaver #2 substructure when the
cable wedge (pressed on bell) on main winch line on the big
Canol bed truck broke dropping the substructure 2 feet from
the ground at 11:00am on Friday, December 13th.

10:45 {00:00 13.25 |MIRU MOVE woDL (P 0.00 0.00 | Shut down rig moving and construction operations until
tomorrow morning. Wait until morning to move and spot rig
and rental equipment.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L.)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mlL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m°)

Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type
BOP Dirill

Days Last Chk (... |Last Date

Days Until Next...

Next Check Date

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days)

793.00

Days Since Recordable Incident {days)

793.00

Safety Incidents

e Date!

Com

Category

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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Report Date: 12/13/2013

Report #: 5

oA Daily Drilling Depth Prorort ki 8
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig:
Al String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run | Drifl Bit Length (m) 1ADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job {(m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
Drill String Components

e itemDes 1D (mm) 0D (mm) Jts Len (m) Cum Len.(m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill...[Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..]WOB (daN) [RPM (r... [SPP (kPa) Drill Str WE (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) [PU Str Wt (daN) [Off-Btm Str W...[ Drill Tq

Hydraulic Calculations

Bit Hydraulic Powe...

HP/Area (kW/mm?)

%P @ bit (%)

Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa)

P Drop Annular (kPa)

Mud Density (kg/m?)

ECD End (kg/m)

Drill String Volume (m®)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?%)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Mode! Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
g :/Daté Depth:(mKB) s i 4 Q Flow (m®/min) : < Pi(Pa) ; Strokes (spm) "
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
; : ‘i “Start Date’ o e e EndDate - ~Liner Size (mm) : P Max (kPa) .. VolIStk OR (m¥/stk).
1712014 112112014 127.0
1122/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
T Date ' Depth (mKB) Q Flow {m*min) P.(kPa) - Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
i Start Date - End Date Liner Size (mm) - 'R Max{kPa) Val/Stk OR (m?/stK)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
12112014 127.0
Shaker Screens
: :Des H StartDate st = "End Date SerSz: X Scr8z Y= Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
sali T Date.s-77, Hrs (hr) RPM: (rpmy Deéns OF (kgim®) -1 QOF.(Uminy: 1 Dens UF (kaim?)." & Q UF:(L/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Do szDale “oHrsithn) i RPM:(rpm) . : “Dens OF:(ka/m3) ::; Q.OF:(L/min).. 1 =Dens UF (kg/iny) = QUE(Umin) :
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
= N & Des Consumed Cost Size Units
«vey Data
L wDate MD (mKB) Incl °)° - f- 0 Azm () TVD (MKB) Depart (m) NS (M) EW (m). - VS () “DLS (*/30m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/13/2013

> Daily Drilling Depth e S
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
mations
Formation:Name Drill Top MD {mKB): Drill Top {TVD}:{mKB) Prog Top TVD.(mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater-River 76.00 76:00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 93844 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol - 1,665.00 1,658.53 1,653.40
Lower Canol -I 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 3/3

Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/14/2013

Report #: 6

h HIH Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mkB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
Tuwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -13.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total {Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
58,109.03 510,397.67 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00( 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 6,771.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -31|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to setting up Beaver #2 rig. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and Conoco reps. Move and spot Beaver #2 substructure and drawworks. Split and
move derrick, move rig buildings and some rental equipment to E-76 65-10 126-45 location from rack site. Wait until morning to spot rig and rental equipment.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, spot Beaver #2 buildings, rental equipment and miscellaneous loads on E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Wait until daylight to finish spotting rig and

rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log

(

; : - Tim ;
Start | i L : o K1 Start Depth: ]~ End Depth * " )
Time' ;| End Time'| :: Dur{hr) Phase QOp Code | Activity.Code[-T=X | - Trbl Code - (mKB). - .. (mKB) - PRI G | “Operation -

)0 |07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE WODL ([P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning.

07:00 {07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 |Hold safety meeting with OK Drilling, Beaver hands, Canol
Trucking and Conoco reps.

07:15 [19:00 11.75|MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 [Move and spot Beaver #2 substructure and drawworks. Split
and move derrick, move rig buildings and some rental
equipment to E-76 65-10 126-45 location from rack site.

19:00 ]00:00 5.00 | MIRU MOVE WODL [P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning to spot rig and rental equipment.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

‘,

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pass) YP Override (Pa)
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m°) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mgiL) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m®) Potassium (mg/L)
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
794.00 794.00

Safety Incidents
e Daté Com i Category -
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

h In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB}) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment

Rpt Template Revised: 8/1
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Report Date: 12/14/2013

- o Daily Drilling Report #: 6
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Ri Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

ig:

J String Components
- - Item Dés A S ID{mm) :0D{(mm) Jis Len {m) = - Cam Len(m)

Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq

Hydraulic:Calculations : — ’ e : BN
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (KW/mm?)  |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m*) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min} |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter {mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
B : Date - L5 Fil el b : Depth'(mKB) : Q Flow (m¥/min) : o PUkPa) B r |7 5 Strokes (spm) |
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
iy -Start Date . : End Date = =2 :Liner.Size. (mm) . : P-Max (kPa) ol Vol/Stk OR (m/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
e Date : : : Dépth (MKB) : Q Flow (m/min) RN I <P (kPa) : ‘i Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
.-amp Operations
S Start Date 3 i End Date: - i Liner.Size (mm) : 0 i P Max (kPa). 7 - - J S5 Vol/BIKOR . (m/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/12014 127.0
Shaker Screens
Des Ty StartDate i End Date -/ i SerSz.X - ScrSz Y i : ‘Note /1
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1/BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Date P S : Hrs (hr) =7 o CHRPM (rpmy). “Dens OF (kg/m?):. ; Q.OF (Lfmin} Dens UF:(kg/m®) e QU (min),
1/19/2014 07.00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
G Date S Hrs (hr) ; : RPM (rpm) Dens OF (kg/m®) . i QIOF (Lfmini) 17 Dens UF (kaim?y i Q UF:{L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
SR : A iDest v i ERE R s Consumed i Cost : Sizéliitiane| s “AUnits
Survey Data
Date . : MD (mKB) ; incl () ° Azm () : TVD (mKB) " v Depart {m) NS () EW. ()i v Vs i{m) DLS (¢/30m)
Formations
s Formation Name =5 > Drill TopMD (mKB) -2 Drill-Top {TVD) {mKB) * : i “Prog Top:TVD {mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River : 76.00 76,00 ~76.00
‘- “c Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
b . .4n House . : : ; ‘QBSﬂ . 17640
Imperial 9756.50 76.40
Upper Canol » : . 1,665:00 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,694.40
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Report Date: 12/15/2013
Report #: 7

c ‘I;h'“' Da I Iy Drl I l ! ng Depth Progress: m

onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

a Rig:

N uwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.

300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOBO1@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -12.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total {Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
58,109.03 568,506.70 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 7,926.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow High Wind -32|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to spotting rig and rental equipment. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 5 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and Conoco reps. Move and pin derrick together, install monkey board, spot mud tanks,
raise a-legs, move miscellaneous rental loads onto E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Wait until morning to finish spotting rig and rental equipment.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, finish spotting rig and rental equipment on E-76 65-10 126-45 location. Wait until morning to hook up sewer lines to sleeper shack, rigging up
boiler and water lines to finish spotting rig and rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log

e 1 Tim : . LR

o start ] : : eP- " Start:Depth End Depth ; B

~ g |.End Time | - Dur (hr); Phigse Op Code " | Activity Code| T-X | Trol Code; (mKB) (mKB) ! 2 Operation- . i

0 |07:00 7.00 (MIRU MOVE wobL [P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.

[07:00 [07:15 0.25 MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 |Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and
Conoco reps.

07:15 119:00 11.76 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Move and pin derrick together, install monkey board, spot
mud tanks, raise a-legs, move miscellaneous rental loads
onto E-76 65-10 126-45 location.

19:00 |(00:00 5.00 |MIRU MOVE WODL P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning to finish spotting rig and rental equipment.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m3) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pacs) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kgim?)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides {mg/L)

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)

Potassium (mg/L}

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Sqlids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m®)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

795.00 795.00
Safety Incidents
Date +Com Category
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nnzzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load {daN)

N it In (MKB)

Depth Out (mKB})

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)

Comment

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 1/2

Report Printed: 4/10/2014




(

Report Date: 12/15/2013
Report #: 7

C ‘ﬁh'“' Dal Iy DrI"Ing Depth Progress: m
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKEB

Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

- Rig:
.i String Components
’ Item Des ID:{mm) QD{mm) Jts Len:{m) Cum'Len (m)

Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate../WOB (daN} |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations : e : At : : e -
Bit Hydraulic Powe..[HP/Area (kW/imm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) [Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m3)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

(

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
i R - Pate - Depth (MKB) - -Q Flow (m¥min)-: P (kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
: Start Date - +End Date Liner. Size (mm) P-Max (kPa) ValiStk OR {m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: 5 Date Depth'(mKB) _+-"Q Flow (m®/min) P (kPa) it Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
‘rump Operations
£ Start Date End Date Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) Ei Vol/Stk OR (m?/stk) .
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/12014 127.0
Shaker Screens
; Des Start Date End Date 8Ser 8z X SerSz Y. Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm}
1| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
o Date Hrs (hr) . 2RPM (rpm) . Dens OF (kg/m?) QOF (Limin) Dens:UF (kg/m®) =1 QUF (Lmin) 5.
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
) : Daté Hrs {hr) ' RPM{rpm) Dens:OF (kg/m3) -2 QOF (Limin), =0 ‘-Dens UF.(kg/m3) 2 QU (Lmin) -
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
saeE : : T b Des Consumed Cost Size . Units i
Survey Data
. Date’ i MD (mKBY Incl (°) Azm'(%) L TVD(mKB) Départ {m) NS{m)* EW:i(m).. | V8 (m) DLS.(*/30m)
Formations
s :Formation‘Name Drill Top MD (mKB) *Drill Top (TVD) {miKB) Prog Top TVD (mKB) -7
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76:00 14.76.00 1 76.00
‘c Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
.- tin House 938:50 93844 76,40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol. L] ,665.100 1,6588.53 1. ¢ 1,653.40
Lower Cano 1,700.72 1 ,689.07-| 1,694.40
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Report Date: 12/16/2013
Report #: 8

- Daily Drilling
HTH Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig:
. UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation {m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -11.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost {Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
343,763.53 912,270.23 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00] 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 9,081.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -39|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to rigging up rig. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 3 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and Conoco reps. Finish spotting rig and rental equipment on E-76 65-10 126-45
location. Wait until morning to warm up rig buildings to hook up power cords, rig up boiler and water lines.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, warm up rig buildings to hook up power cords, rig up boiler and water lines. Wait until morning to rig to raise derrick.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log

e Tim ; s -
start - ; i . 8P ‘ i| startDepth: | End Depth ,
Time ;| End'Time | Dur (hr) Phase Op Code | -Activity'Code | T-X:| . Trbl Code (mKB) 1. (MKB) . Opeération
~7 90 |07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE wobL [P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning.
Jo 107:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands, Canol Trucking and
Conoco reps.
07:15 [19:00 11.75 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 [Finish spotting rig and rental equipment on E-76 65-10 126-
] 45 location.
19:00 |00:00 5.00 | MIRU MOVE WODL P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning to warm up rig buildings to hook up power
cords, rig up boiler and water lines.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kg/m?)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L)

Calcium {mg/L)

Lime (kg/m°)

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Es

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... {Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
796.00 796.00
Safety Incidents
Date Com Category

Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) {mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD {mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
|P~nth In (MKB) Depth Out (MKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...]Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
v winment
Drill String Components
: 5 A i “Item Des 1D, (mm) QD (mim), s sLen(m) scumLen (m)

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/16/2013

Report #: 8

C Vh’ ] Daily Drilling Dopth Preort#: 8

ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada W Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

) Rig:

.iing Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB

Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [ SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq

Hydraulic Calculations L : , : * :

Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

{

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
o Date Depth (mKB) " Q Flow:{m*min) P.{kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
S Start Date H ; End Date Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) - VoliStlk OR (m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
112212014 112212014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
fageie B Date Depth'(mKB) Q Flow (m*/min) P{kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
Ry Start Date : ® End Date Lirier Size (mm) : P:Max(kPa) ~ Vol/Stk'OR (m*/stk)
2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
~,21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
- Des.:: 0z - Start Date” End Date Scr SziXii Scr.Szy Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
st Date Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm) Dens OF (kg/m®) Q OF (L/min) Dens UF:(kg/m®) & Q:UF/(L/min}
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
S Date Hrs:(hr) RPM (rpm) Dens OF(kg/m?) it :Q OF (L/min) :Dens UF (kg/m®) - - Q UF (Lmyin) .
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
s . ; Des’ Consumed " Cast Size Units
Survey Data
g ‘Date LMD (mKB) 2l (D) Azm {°). TVD (mKB) Depart (m) NS (m) “AEW.(m) VS (m) i DLS:(°/30m) :
Formations
ED Formation-Name Drill -Top MD:(mKB) 3 Drill Top (TVD) (mKB}) Prog Top.TVD.(mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Srlater River 76.00_I 076,00 76A00J
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin} House i : 93}8‘. 50 938.44 7640
 Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
2r Canol 1:665:00 1,;658.53 ,653.40
[Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/17/2013
Report #: 9

C ‘l;h'“' | Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mK8
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
) Rig:
.. uwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -10.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
45,806.53 958,076.76 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00]10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB}) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 75.0 711.00 9,792.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -36|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to rigging up to raise derrick.. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, warm up rig buildings, plug in power cords, rig up boiler lines and circulate steam around the rig. Wait until morning to rig up
derrick to raise, raise derrick and rig up pre-fabs.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, rig up derrick to raise, raise derrick and rig up pre-fabs. Wait until morning to rig up water lines and rental equipment.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
: Tim L . o
- Start i H R VeED Coosle P ' Start Depth | End Depth
.Time: |'End Time | Dur (hr) Phase Op Code Activity Code| T:X | ~ Trbl Code {(mKB) (mKB) . 3 Operation
( ~ 10 |07:00 7.00 | MIRU MOVE WODL [P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.

. J0 |o715 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands and Conoco reps.

07:15 |19:00 11.75 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 |Warm up rig buildings, plug in power cords, rig up boiler lines
and circulate steam around the rig.

19:00 [00:00 5.00(MIRU MOVE WObL |P 0.00 0.00 [ Wait until morning to rig up derrick to raise, raise derrick and
rig up pre-fabs.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pas) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m®)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L})

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Fittrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface {m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Es

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud L

ost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type
BOP Dirill

Days Last Chk (...

Last Date

Days Until Next...

Next Check Date

Days Since Lost Time Incident {days)

797.00

Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

797.00

Safety Incidents

Date

< .Com

‘Category

Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>

Bit Run |Drill Bit

Length (m) IADC Bit Dull

TFA (incl Noz) (mm?)

BHA ROP (m/hr)

Nozzles (mm)

String Length (m)

OD (mm)

Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
ment
Drill String Components
i Item Des ID (mm) 0D (mm) sidts Leni{m) Cumi-Len (m)
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Report Date: 12/17/2013
Report #: 9

c Vh'll' Daily Drilling Dot proTonF: S

onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
) Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

Rig:

.. .aing Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..]WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq

Hydratilic Calculations ; . . : : S

Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Date Depth (mKB) Q Flow (m?/min) ; P:(kPa) : Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
e Start Date | End Date Liner Size.(mm) : P:Max'(kPa) " L5 VoliStcOR (m/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
e :Date Depth (MKB) ; Q Flow (m¥min). - P (kPa) .. B Strokes (spm).~
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
i 2 Stat Date i End Date Liner Size:(mrm):: P:Max (kPa) ; Vol/Stk-OR (m®/stk)
12014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
"1:21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
Des StartDate End Date ScrSz:X Scrsziy. Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
ge 1] Date’ Hrs:{hr) RPM.(rpm) Dens.OF:(kg/m®) Q OF{l/min) = Dens UF (kg/m®), . QUF (Lminy.
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
g Hi sDate : Hrs (hr) RPM(rbm) Dens OF (kg/m?) QOF (L/min) ;20 Dens UF (kg/m®) Q UF (Lfmifn)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
R : , ; G Des Consuiried Cost Size*™ #rUnits
Survey Data
Date ‘MD {mKB) “] sninel () Azm.(?) TVD (mKB): Depart (m) NS (m) EW (m) 28| :vSi(m) DLS (°/30m)
Formations
il “Formation Name Drill Top;MD (mKB) ; “:DrillTop (TVD):(KB) “"Prag Top TVD(mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76,00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin"House . 938,50 938.44 7640
| Imnerial 975.50 975.43 76.40
erCanol-+ 1,665.00 1,658.53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 12/18/2013

- Daily Drilling Doty RCPOTLE 10
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 6.00mKB
) Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

" Rig:
~UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB0O1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {m) Casing Flange Elevation {(m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -9.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
40,181.53 998,258.29 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00] 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 10,947.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -31|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to rigging up to circulate water around rig. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, rig up derrick to raise, raise derrick and rig up pre-fabs. Wait until morning to rig up water lines and rental equipment.

24hr Forecast
Hold safety meeting, rig up rig up water lines and rental equipment. Wait until morning to rig up rig floor and fill the mud tanks.

Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

(

Time Log
oy e : Tim e f
Start e Lo ‘ . 2 2| epP- il Start Dépth End Depth i
:Time:2| End Time |- Dur:(hr) Phase Op Cade Activity Code|:T-X | .Trbl Code 2 (mKB) (mKB). L - Operation,
/QO:OO 07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE WODL P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until moming.

0 {07:15 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands and Conoco reps.
w156 119:00 11.75|MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 [Rig up derrick to raise, raise derrick and rig up pre-fabs.
19:00 (00:00 5.00 |MIRU MOVE WODL [P 0.00 0.00 [Wait until morning to rig up water lines and rental equipment.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m%) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m3) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date

BOP Drill :
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

798.00 798.00

Safety Incidents

: Date W B : Sl Com % A i s : o : Category.
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) ) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs {hr} Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment

( 1 String Components

B : Sltem Des i+ s R e BT D . mim) OD-(mm) “ts e Len (m) -:cum Len-(m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... [Int ROP (... |[Flow Rate..]WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
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Report Date: 12/18/2013

Report #: 10

C »I;h‘ll' Daily Drilling boptn Rror
ep { m
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mia
- Canadaxs Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
... 4raulic Calculations 2 . . : S
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m?®) [ECD End (kg/m?)
Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
G ‘Date Depth (mKB) , Q Flow (m¥min} P.(kPa) : . Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
i o Start Date S arss o End Date Liner Size (mim) P Max (kPa) 5 NMolStk:OR (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
112212014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
ey ; Date Depth {mKB) : Q Flow:(m¥min) P:{kPa)’ " " Strokes.(spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations .
Start Date : " Erid Date Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR (m?/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
"~ 1Ker Screens
( Des Start Date End Date Ser sz X Ser8z-Y, Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
S Date : Hrs (hr) RPM {rpm) Dens. OF:(kg/m®) Q OF:(L/min) . : -Dens UF. (kg/m*) Q UF-(L/min) ;-
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: Date - CHrs (b : RPM {rpm) Dens OF (kg/m®) *.Q OF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m®) QUF{L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
s 5 “Des, Consumed ;- ChrCost i nSizeis Units 1040
Survey Data
iiDate MD(mKB) . znel (5). “Azm () TVD (mKB) Depart (m) NS (m)-: EW (rm) VS (m) DLS (%/30m)
Formations
T . " /Formation'Narmg Drill -Top MD (mKB) - Drill Top (TVD).(mKB) i Prog Top TVD (MKB) -
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 . 76:00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938,50 938.44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol : 3 _1,665:09 ;658:53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1 ,689.071 1,694.40
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Report Date: 12/19/2013

A Daily Drilling copt
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKEB
i Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
‘ Rig:
TUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -8.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE/ RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
40,181.53 1,038,439.82 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 12,102.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature {°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -33|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to rigging up to fill mud tanks. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, rig up water lines and rental equipment. Wait until morning to rig up rig floor and fill the mud tanks.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, rig up rig floor and fill the mud tanks. Wait until morning to set up and load pipe racks with surface BHA.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
S - Tim : - B
-Start : : : ‘[eP- Start Depth End-Dépth )
. Time::. | End Time | -Dur:(hr) Phase _0p Code.. | Activity Code | T-X |- Trbl Code {mKB) (mKB) QOperation
00:00 |07:00 7.00 |[MIRU MOVE WODL P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning.
( 70 |07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands.
vri15 119:00 11.75 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 |Rig up water lines and rental equipment.
19:00 }00:00 5.00 |[MIRU MOVE WODL [P 0.00 0.00 [ Wait until morning to rig up rig floor and fill the mud tanks.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
Electric Stab (V) ECD ~ Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m3)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?3)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

r—

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill
Days Since Lost Time Incident {(days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
799.00 799.00
Safety Incidents
iarDate Gom:+ .= Category
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) {(mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP {m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
" Il String Components
) L S Jtem.Des D (mm) 0D (mm) Jts = en (my:s Cum:Len{(m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... {Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drifl Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
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Report Date: 12/19/2013

Report #: 11

h 4 H(H Dally Drl"lng Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
.., «raulic Calculations : o ] : R e - 2
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?3)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV {m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)

1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks

! i Date Depth {mKB) - Q Flow (m*min) P (kPa) B Strokes (spm)

1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations

: : Stait Date . End Date Liner Size (mm) -P-Max (kRa) -/ VolIStk OR (m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0

1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks

k1 -Date 1:Depth (mKB) Q Flow (m*/min}:;: i P (kPa) : . Strokés ' (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations

a2 -Start Date s End Date - Liner:Size (mm) : P Max (kPa)’ : Vol/Stk OR (m¥stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000

1/21/2014 127.0
" 1ker Screens

" Des Start Date End Date SerSz-X ScrSz. Y. - :“Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
e Date Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm)-&:. Dens OF (kg/m?) Q OF {(L/miin) -Déns:UF: (kg/m*) - QUE(Uminy 5
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500

Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks

i o :Date i Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm} Denis OF (kg/m?) = Q OF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m%) - “QUE{L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts

Al g ~Des Consumed -Cost Size il Units
Survey Data
Date . MD(mKB) nel (%) AZM(Y) TVD (MKB) " Depart (m) NS'{m) EW (m) V5 (m) ©"DLS(/30m) -

Formations

L ek #.:" :Formation Name L TEDil Top MD{mKB) Drill - Top (TVD) {mKB) . ProgTop TVD:(mKB)
Little Bear _L 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River: 76.00 76:00 76:00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House - = 938.50 938.44 76.40
mperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper.Canol 1,665.00 1.658.53] 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 12/21/2013

Report #: 13

hilli Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
11UwI ’ Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -6.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
40,181.53 1,118,802.88 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00]10351817 34.19

Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB)

Override TVD (mKB)

Head Count

Personnel Total Hours (hr)

Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)

2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 14,412.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -30{NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to laying diverter lines. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, fil the mud tanks, set up, load pipe racks with surface BHA and start to rig up diverter lines to flare tank. Wait until morning
to prep cellar for rotating head and rig up diverter lines to flare tank.

24hr Forecast

Hold safety meeting, prep cellar for rotating head and rig up diverter lines to flare tank. Wait until morning to finish rigging up diverter lines and weld on RCD Head.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String

Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
iy . ) Tim i
Start’ | : U : . j wele Pl +i| i Start:Depth End Depth
Time: -|'End Time | . Dur (hr) Phase. . Op:Cade Activity Code| T-X | :Trbl Codé (mKB) (mKB) L Operation::
~":00 |07:00 7.00 |MIRU MOVE wobL [P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.
_ .00 |07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands.
07:15 [19:00 11.75 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Fill the mud tanks, set up, load pipe racks with surface BHA
and start to rig up diverter lines to flare tank.
19:00 (00:00 5.00 |MIRU MOVE woDL [P 0.00 0.00 [ Wait until morning to prep cellar for rotating head and rig up
diverter lines to flare tank.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Qil Water Ratio Chlorides {mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manuat Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Est

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud L

ost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill

Type
BOP Dirill

Days Last Chk (... |Last Date

Days Until

Next... [Next Check Date

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days)

801.00

Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

801.00

Safety Incidents

i Date

Jiin Com

CondiCategorys s i

Drill String: BHA

# <BHA No.?>

Bit Run |Drill Bit

Length (m) IADC Bit Dull

TFA (incl Noz) (mm?)

BHA ROP (m/hr)

Nozzles (mm)

String Length (m)

OD (mm)

Max Rotating Hook

Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP

{m/hr) Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

ment

Drill String Components

ltem Des &

1D{mm)

OD (mm)

Jts

Len.(m)

Cum:Len(m)
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Report Date: 12/21/2013

Report #: 13

C Vh'll' Daily Drilling beptn RPN 13

onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
) Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

) Rig:

. aling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill...|Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... {SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq

Hydraulic Calculations g L : : : . .

Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to

Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
“EriitoiDate’ t Depth{mKB) Q Flow-{r?/min) P(kPa) - 5 Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
. : + Start Date End Date Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR (m*/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
oo F Date Depth (mKB) Q Flow (m2/min) ‘P-{KPa) "Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
el -Start:Date - " Epd Date - Liner.Size (mm);i: | P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR: (m?/stk)
V2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
112112014 127.0
Shaker Screens
; CyaiidiiDes i Stat Date . -End Date ScrSz X, ScrSz-Y: Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i - Date & Hrs*(hr) -~ RPM (rpm) Dens OF.(kg/m®) Q-OF (L/min) - Dens UF.(kg/m?) Q UF:{L/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: it Date Hrs {hr) RPM {rpm)j " :Dens OF (Kg/m?) i 2Q OF:(Lmin) | Dens UF (kg/m®) = Q.UF. (Lmin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
s B O : 7:Dés. Consumed Cost .- Sizg: Uniits ;%
Survey Data
i Datellin MD.(mKB) Incl. (%) AZm (%) ¥ TVD (mKBJ Dapart (m) o052 NS (m) EWi{(m) .. VS (m) o] 4 DLS-(30m)
Formations
o . 'Formation Name Drill Top:MD (mKB) Drill Top (TVD) (MKB)* Prog Top TVD (mKB})
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76,001, 176.00 L =96,00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin:House © - 03850 938.44 76.40
I'nerial 975.50 975.43 76.40
er Canol - e = 166500 1,658.53 1,653:40
ftower Canol T 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/22/2013
Report #: 14

c ‘6h’“' Daily Dri"ing Depth Progress: m

onocorhilips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
' Rig:

( L TuUwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {(m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -5.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
40,181.53 1,158,984.41 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00[10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 15,567.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -31|NwW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Hold safety meeting prior to prepping cellar to weld on RCD Head. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 2 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, prep cellar for rotating head and rig up diverter lines to flare tank. Wait until morning to install weight indicator, prep cellar for
rotating head, weld on 20" adapter flange to the 20" conductor, install and hammer on spool.

24hr Forecast

Install weight indicator, prep cellar for rotating head, weld on 20" adapter flange to the 20" conductor, install 20" spool.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-998-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
S Tim e
Start p E eP- Start Depth End Depth o :
Time | End Time.|.-Dur (hr) Phase Op Cade Activity Code|-T-X |- Trbl:Code .. (mKB) (mKB) ; 2 Operation -,
70 |07:00 7.00 [MIRU MOVE wOobL [P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning.
_ .00 [07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 |Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands.
07:15 [19:00 11.75 |MIRU MOVE MOB P 0.00 0.00 | Prep cellar for rotating head and rig up diverter lines to flare
tank.
19:00 |00:00 5.00 |[MIRU MOVE WODL |P 0.00 0.00 | Wait until morning to prep cellar for rotating head, weld on
RCD Head and begin rigging up torque tube.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB)

Density (kgim)

Funnel Viscosity (s/L)

pH

PV Override (Pas)

YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m°)

QOil Water Ratio

Chilorides (mg/L)

Calcium (mgiL)

Lime (kg/m?®)

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole {(m?)

Daily Mud Field Est

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... {Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

802.00 802.00
Safety Incidents
: ‘Lot Date ] Com Category';::
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |[Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
( iment
Drill String Components
P aeas - ltém Dés 221D (mm) S 0DmmY celts, seElen (m) : Cum Len.(m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/22/2013
Report #: 14

C ‘Igh'“' Dal Iy Drl I I I ng Depth Progress: m
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig:
- «illing Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... [Flow Rate../WOB (daN) |RPM {(r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... |SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations : : ;
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m°) |ECD End (kg/m®)
Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |[Max Casing AV (m/min} [Min Open Hole AV {m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: = Daté Depth (mKB) QFlow {mmin) P.(kPa) | Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
i 1.0 Start Date 1 s ¥ ~:~End Date Liner Size:(mm) P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR-{(m*/stk) |
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
S Date Depth (mKB}) Q Flow (mm*/min) P.(kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 ) 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
Start Date : End:Date - Linér Size (mm) i el P:Max'(kPa) - . Vol/Stk OR (m¥/stk)
92014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/121/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
b Des Start Date End Date 1 BerSz Xl I8erSziY: Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1{BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
= Lo Date : Hrs ¢hr) ) RPM-(rpm) Dens OF.(kg/m?) Q OF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m®) QUE(Umin)™> "%
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter {mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
S iDate Hrs (hr) RPM (rpmj - Dens OF (kg/m?):. |/ SQOF(L/min) i Bens UF (kg/m2) = Q.UF{(L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
i Stah TS Des Consumed Cost Size Units
Survey Data
Date - MD(mKB) gl (%) Azm (°) TVD{mKB) Depart (m) NS (m) EW () VS{m) DLS (2/30m)
Formations
et Formation Name 2" Drill Top MD {mKB) Drill Top<(TVD){mKB} Prog TopTVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76,00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 93844 76.40
. Mmperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
X perCanol. - 1:665:00 1:658.53 1,653.40
TLower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 2/2

Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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Report Date: 12/23/2013
Report #: 156

»< Daily Drilling
HTH Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
«TUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {(m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -4.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
83,003.53 1,241,987.94 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00]10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 113.0 1,155.00 16,722.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -32|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Rig up torque tube. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 3 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Wait until morning. Hold safety meeting, install weight indicator, prep cellar for rotating head, weld on 20" adapter flange to the 20" conductor, install 20" spool.

24hr Forecast

Weld on 20" adaptor flanges onto 20" conductor. Rig up Schlumberger 8068 Rotating Head, 2 x hydraulic valves, 10" flow line and 8" flare tank. Rig up torque tube

and pick up top drive.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS

Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
. Tim Lo
“iStart ) , : ep- : Start. Depth “:End‘Depth
Time = |:End Time!| Dur (hr) Phase .. Op Code 1" | Activity Code| T-X | - Trbl;Code “(mKB) s (mKBY ; : “Operation
‘00 |07:00 7.00 |IMIRU MOVE WODL ([P 0.00 0.00 |Wait until morning.
.:00 (07:16 0.25 |[MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Hold safety meeting with Beaver hands.
07:15 |00:00 16.75 |[MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 [ Install weight indicator, prep cellar for rotating head, weld on
20" adapter flange to the 20" conductor, install 20" spool.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m®) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L}) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

AP Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole {m?)

Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m®)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
803.00 803.00
Safety Incidents
e Date =-Com Category
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
~omment
1rill String Components
ltem Des SlD(mm) S -I : 0D (mm) Jts - Len'(m) = i:CumrLen(m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/23/2013

o Daily Drilling Depth Pragress: m
ConocoPChl“lpS COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
anada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

. aling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB .
Cum Depth (m) |Cum Dirill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq

Hydraulic Calculations : . - : g E E :
Bit Hydraulic Powe...[|HP/Area (kW/imm?)  [% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) [Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m*) |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill S$tring Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |[Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: siDater ; Depth (mKB) Q Flow:(m*min) L AP kPa) : Strokes, {sprm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
Start Date ) End Date: : g ' Liner Size (mm) - L P:Max:(kPay . - i BV oIStk OR {m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm})
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
S Date i : : : 2:-Depth (mKB) e " Q Flow {m®/min) ; P (kPa) .- Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
: : Start-Date .- W S Erid Date . Lanrliner-Size {mm). P.Max (kPa) W) VoliStk OR:(mé/stk)
12014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
112112014 127.0
Shaker Screens
Des i L StartDate i GEnd Date i p Ser Sz X “8er. Sz Y- : +Notg

Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500

Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Date ™ i <nHrs(hn : RPM:(rpm) Dens OF:(kg/m®) . Q- OF(LUmin) Dens. UF (ka/m?) j S QUF (Lmin)ss
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0| 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
, . Date i Hrsi(hr) = RPM {rpnt) Dens OF (kg/m?) Q OF (Limin) - :-Dens UF (kg/m*) L QUEUmim
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
. LA : L < Des : : .Consumed e Cost ; 5 Size': ; Units ;2
Survey Data
: -::Date ; 22 MD(mKB) Incl () Azm (%) - ETVD (MKB) :: Depart.(m) NS.(m) EW (m) _| VS (m) -DLS (5/30m) -
Formations
- e Formation Name : : Bk Drill Top MD.{mKB) Drill Top (TVD) (mKB) -.: Prog:Top TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River = : L sl ey 76.00 76.00J f Lo 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House E | ' 938.50 o0 038M4 1 L e 0 77640
"perial 975.50 975.43 76.40
X ser Canol o R : 1,665.00 s e 1658.58 1 : 1,653.40
[ Lower Canol 1,700.721 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/2 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/24/2013
Report #: 16

¢ HIH Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
_oaluwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m)

Original KB/RT E

evation (m)

Casing Flange Elevation (m)

Original Spud Date

Days From Spud (days)

268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -3.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE | RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
66,343.53 1,308,331.47 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00( 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 44.0 516.00 17,238.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -38|Calm
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Rig up top drive. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 6 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out).

Weld on 20" adaptor flanges onto 20" conductor. Rig up Schlumberger 8068 Rotating Head and install service loop.

24hr Forecast

Install 2 hydraulic valves, rig up 10" flow line and 8" flare tank. Rig up top drive. Pre-mix mud in mud tanks.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS

Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
o Tim : . .
Start 2 F ’ ePp- “Start Depth End Depth
Time:: | End-Time | .Pur(hr) Phase Op Code Activity Code | T-X:| Trbl.Code (mKB) (mKB) Operation
00:00 |00:15 0.25|MIRU RIGMNT [SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig service
16 |00:30 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Pre job safety meeting -Nipple up

-.»:30 |05:00 4.50 IMIRU WHDBOP [NUND P 0.00 0.00 [Nipple up bottom section of rotating equiptment, rig up flare
lines

05:00 [07:45 2.75|MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 { De-ice torque tube and prepare to install torque tube

07:45 [08:00 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

08:00 |08:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting with day crew prior to picking up torque tube

08:15 |08:30 0.25[MIRU RIGMNT |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 | Rig service, function test crown saver

08:30 [12:00 3.50 | MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 | Pick up and install torque tube

12:00 |16:00 4.00 | MIRU WHDBOP [NUND P 0.00 0.00 [ Cut conductor, weld on flange and install diverter spool

16:00 [16:15 0.25|MIRU RIGMNT  [SVRG P 0.00 0.00 | Rig service

16:15 |19:45 3.50 |IMIRU WHDBOP |NUND P 0.00 0.00 [ Continue to weld flanges to install rotating head

19:45 (20:00 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

20:00 |00:00 4.00 |[MIRU WHDBOP |NUND P 0.00 0.00 | Continue to weld and install rotating equipment

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB)

Density (kg/m?)

Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH

PV Override (Pas)

YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L)

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
IBOP Drill
's Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
- 804.00 804.00
Safety Incidents
.Date ’ 1 Com :Category
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Daily Drilling

Report Date: 12/24/2013

Report #: 16

»
H | H Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
» Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
(’ Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
..i String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook L.oad (daN)

Depth In (mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drifl Hrs (hr)

Comment

Drill String Components

¢z tem Des i IDA{mm). ODb'(mm) Jis Len (m) Cum'Len(mj .
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill...|Int ROP (... |[Flow Rate..[WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) [PU Str Wt (daN) [ Off-Btm Str W...{ Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations ; ir : : o e Sl |
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m?®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
Drill $tring Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: i Date Depth.{mKB) G - Q Flow {m*/min) P.(kPa) : Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
R Start Date . e End Date Liner Size {mm) (P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR-(im*/stk) .-
12014 1/21/2014 127.0
[1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
; B ; ;o2 Date Depth (mKB) ; Q Flow-(m¥min) P-(kPa) : "Strokes.(spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
L =Ll Start Date B “End Date Liner-Size (mm) P Max (kPa) VoliStk OR (m?/stk) i
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
-Des:: Start Date End Date: =, HALSeRSZEX Scr-SziYo v Note "k
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
; Date’«i-du il iy Hrs(hr) = e RPM:(rpm) =’ Dens OF (kg/m®) QOF (L/min) i Dens UF (kg/m%) 0 QUFA{Liming e
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
e Date = 2 Hrs:(hr) RPM{rpm) : - Dens OF (kg/m%) . QIOF (Lfmin) - Dens UF.(kg/m?) " QUF:{L/min) 2
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
o : % Des Consumed .Cost Size i24:2Units,
wurvey Data
“Date . -MD (mKB) . Incl (°) Azm (%) |- TVD.{mKB) Depait (m) “NS(m) EW.(m) VS (my- | DLS(3/30m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/24/2013

- Daily Drilling oep e
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
i Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
‘ ‘ Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. .«mations
e Formation Name Drill Top-MD{mKB) Drill Top (TVD) (mKB) Prog Top TVD {mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 938.44 7640
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 1,658.53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 3/3

Report Printed: 4/10/2014




»

ConocoPhillips

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Daily Drilling

Report Date: 12/25/2013
Report #: 17
Depth Progress: m

Depth End: 0.00mKB

( .oJuwn
300E7665-10126-45

Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -2.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost {Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
99,893.53 1,408,225.00 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00( 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 41.0 483.00 17,721.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -42|Calm
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Rig up and test top drive. Work on mud pumps. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 9 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Install service loop, rig up, test and troubleshoot PLC (programmable logic controller) issues with top drive. Rig up BOS Il tank and centrifuge combo tank.

24hr Forecast

Install 2 hydraulic valves, rig up 10" flow line and 8" flare tank. Rig up top drive. Pre-mix mud in mud tanks.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log

Start : e ; ;’ lFrp- Start Depth End Depth:"
Time -] ‘End Time { - Dur {hr) Phase Op:Code Activity Code | T-X| - Trbl Code {mKB) (mKB) Operation
100:00 [00:15 0.25|MIRU RIGMNT  |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 [Rig service
( 16 |02:45 2.50 IMIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 | Prepare service loop to hang from monkey board

vz45 |03:00 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Pre job safety meeting on hanging service loop

03:00 |[07:45 4.75 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 |Hang service loop

07:45 |08:00 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

08:00 |08:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting prior to picking up top drive

108:15 108:30 0.25 |MIRU RIGMNT  |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 | Rig service, function test crown saver

08:30 (16:00 7.50 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 |Rig in top drive to service loop and test censors

16:00 (16:15 0.25|MIRU RIGMNT  |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig service

16:15 |19:00 2.75|MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 | Continue to rig up top drive to service loop and function
Censors.

19:00 [19:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

19:15 |19:30 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting on camp rules and etiquette

19:30 |00:00 4.50 |[MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 |Rig up, de-ice and warm equipment prior to installing

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%) [MBT (kg/m%) Qil Water Ratio Chlorides (mgiL) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m%) Potassium {mg/L})
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... | Next Check Date
BOP Dirill
~~vs Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
805.00 805.00
~wdfety Incidents
Date Coin i Category
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/25/2013

Report #: 17

» Daily Drilling
illi Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
. Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.l String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job {(m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

Comment

Drill String Components

ltem Des 1D, (mrr) 0D (mm) Jts Len'{m) - Cum Lén (m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |int ROP (... [Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) {RPM {(r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... |SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations et . Nl S o
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kWW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m® |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...|M

ax Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

(

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: : Date Depth (mKB) o Q Flow (m*/min) P (kPa) - Strokes (spi)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
il K Start Date : Erid Date - :Liner Size (mm) . P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR (mé¥/stk)
172014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 112212014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
5 “Date Depth.(mKB) : Q Flow (m*/min) Et P'(kPa) - Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,613.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
g Start Date End Date Linet Size (mm) ‘P.Max (kPa); gL “ \oliStk OR (m?/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
G e Y Des i Start:Date: End-Date ScrSz X% ScrSz.Y. wiENote
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm}
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
e Date i Hrs (Hr) ol o RPM:{rpm) <=-Dens OF (kg/m®) QOF (L/min) Déns UF.(kg/m?) <2Q UFi(L/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Mode! Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
GRS Date coHrs (hry i ZRPM(rpm) Dens OF (kg/m?) Q OF.(L/min).: . 'Dens UEA(Kg/m®): = QUE(L/miny .o &0
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
. : P e Des Gonsumed = :Cost iSize Units
(sSurvey Data
Date MD (mKB) =Inel (%) Azm (°) TVD(nKB) - Depart(m): NS -(m) EW.(m) VS (m)s DLS {°/30m)
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/25/2013

A Daily Drilling oeptn B
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
mations

: Formiation Name - “Diill Top MD (mKBY) Drill Top(TVD)-(mKB) Prog Top TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 93&5()_I 938.44 76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 1,658.53 1,653:40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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»

ConocoPhillips

Daily Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Report Date: 12/26/2013
Report #: 18

Depth Progress: m
Depth End: 0.00mKB

n Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. Juwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB0O1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -1.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total {Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
86,003.53 1,494,228.53 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00| 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 44.0 519.00 18,240.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature {°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -44|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Prep, strap BHA and troubleshoot PLC. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 7 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Rig up, test and troubleshoot PLC (programmable logic controller) issues with top drive. Rig up BOS Il tank and centrifuge combo tank. Re-adjusted service loop.
Rig in and weld diverter valves, lines, 10" flowline fine and 8" booey line. Held high angle rescue meetings with rig crews.

24hr Forecast

Troubleshoot PLC (programmable logic controller) issues with top drive, install anti-collision program to top drive, complete top drive checks and function, conduct
pre-spud checklist, pre-mix mud in mud tanks, pick up and make up BHA, spud and drill 311mm surface hole.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
R ] ] Tim ; it
Stait. “ ke ; W eP- i Start Depth ‘End Pepth ! g
( ‘me:: |:End Time)] © Diir(hr) -« Phiase Op Cade | Activily Code| T-X | /Trbl Code | . (mKB) 1 (mKBY; e i Operation
00 |00:15 0.25 [MIRU RIGMNT |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 [Rig service

00:15 |[01:15 1.00 [MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [High angle rescue drill, confined space lift drill with tri-pod

01:15 |01:30 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 { BOP drill / diverter procedure, review for tripping and drilling

01:30 |07:45 6.25 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 [ Inspect pump fluid ends, seats and valves, de-ice and warm
up diverter valves

07:45 |(08:00 0.25|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

08:00 08:15 0.25 [MIRU RIGMNT |[SVRG P 0.00 0.00 [Rig service

08:15 [10:00 1.76 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting, review Beaver drilling J S.A's notification and
high angel rescue drill

10:00 |12:30 2.50 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 |Work on top drive functions and calibrate censors

12:30 |16:00 3.50|MIRU WHDBOP |NUND P 0.00 0.00| Rig up R.C.D head, diverter system and prepare to weld on
flanges for flow and flare lines

16:00 |16:15 0.25[MIRU RIGMNT |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig service

16:15 |16:30 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting prior to welding valve flanges

16:30 |19:00 2.50 |[MIRU WHDBOP |NUND P 0.00 0.00 | Nipple up / rotating equipment and weld flanges, 10" and 8 "
lines, for flow and flare lines

19:00 |19:30 0.50 [MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 |Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps. Safety meeting prior to installing diverter valves

19:30 |00:00 4.50 (MIRU WHDBOP {NUND P 0.00 0.00 | Nipple up flow and flare line, diverter valves

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time

Depth (mKB)

Density (kg/m®)

Funnel Viscosity (s/L)

pH

PV Override (Pass)

YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kgim’)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L)

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)}

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

o~~~

Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field

Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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Report Date: 12/26/2013
Report #: 18

o HIH Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
—_.st BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
806.00 806.00
Safety Incidents
Date Com " Category
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m} Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment

Drill String Components

: L 7kiem Des 1D (mirn) .. oD (mm) Js oLen (m)id ..-'Cum Leri{m):
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) [RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations fLE i & : : L e i
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m?) |ECD End (kg/m®)

Drill String Volume (m?3)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

1**'d Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

( «p Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Gt - Date Depth (MKB) R Q.Flow (m3min) . Ri(kPa) 3 ) Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
(o i1 Start.Date End Date Liner Size (mm) . 8 i+ P:Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR (m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
‘ . .xDate Depth (mKB) i . ~Q-Flow (m*/min} R.(kPa) . - “Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
e Start Date v : End Date. Liner Size (mm) . i P:Max (kPa) h Volf/Stk OR:(m¥/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
EDESs - Start Date wEnd:Date: i ScrSzX Scr8z . Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: ] Datg ‘. o “waHrsi(hr) RPM{rpm) . Dens OF (kg/m®) QOF {(L/miny.. i Dens UF{kg/m3) QUF-{Lfmin)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
( itrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
b G EasDate =2 Hs (hr) ALRPMArpm) s Dens OF (kg/m?) -Q OR{LImin) Dens UF (kg/m3)* Q.UFEALmin}
1/19/2014 13.00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
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Report Date: 12/26/2013

C ‘I;h'll' Daily Drilling oot RSROTLH: 18
onocorhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
id / Mud Additive Amounts
S . Des Consumed Cost Size Units
Survey Data
Date MD (mKB) Ingl (%) Azm (°). TVD.{mKB) Depart (mi) NS:(m) EW (m) " VS.(m) DLS (°/30m)
Formations
- Formation:Name Drill Top:-MD (mKB) - Drilt Top (TVD) (mKB) Prog Top TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin'House 938.50 938.44 76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper.Canol 1,665;00 1,658.563 1,653:40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/27/2013
Report #: 19

Yohilli Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 0.00mKE
, Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. Jduwl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m}) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 -0.27
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
72,600.18 1,5666,828.71 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMID) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 44.0 519.00 18,759.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Clear -45] NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Spud and drill 311mm surface hole at 6:30hrs on December 28, 2013. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 8 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Troubleshoot PLC (programmable logic controller) issues with top drive, install 10" flowline, install anti-collision program to top drive, complete top drive checks and
function, pre-mix mud in mud tanks. Conduct pre-spud inspection, fill out pre-spud and rig inspection checklists. Make up surface BHA.

Midnight to 6:30hrs: Make up BHA, circulate and check for leaks. Perform 'Hazard Hunt' with rig crew. Spud and drill 311mm surface hole at 6:30hrs on December
28, 2013. Sent pre-spud Beyond Compliance, pre-spud inspection and rig inspection checklists prior to spudding.

24hr Forecast

Drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 200m+/-.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
. b : Tim . :
o o sl e - e Start Depth. End Depth ;
me” z|/End Time} - Durithn) .|« .. Phase Op Code Activity Code | T=X | .. Trbl Code {mKB) . (mKB) Operation [

00:00 |00:15 0.25 |MIRU RIGMNT |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig Service, function motor shut off's, work ok.

00:15 |07:00 6.75 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 [Rig in pipe rack and load with BHA, HWDP, finish tie in flare
line to flare tanck and check all connections on lis and
diverter

07:00 |07:15 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

07:15 |08:00 0.75|MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Rig inspection walk around with driller and Conoco rep.

08:00 |08:15 0.25|MIRU RIGMNT  |SVRG P 0.00 0.00 | Rig service.

08:15 |08:30 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Safety meeting prior to setting up rig smart anti collision
system.

08:30 [16:00 7.50 |MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 |Rig in rig smart anti collision system with system hand.

16:00 (16:15 0.25 |MIRU RIGMNT [SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig service, function horn.

16:15 |[19:00 2.75|MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 | Finish rigging up top drive, recalibrate all functions

19:00 |19:30 0.50 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

19:30 (23:30 4.00 |[MIRU MOVE RURD P 0.00 0.00 | Continue to rig up top drive, mud saver valve and saver sub,
recalibrate rig smart.

23:30 |[23:45 0.25 |MIRU MOVE SFTY P 0.00 0.00 [ Safety meeting prior to picking up 9" drill collars and installing
311mm tooth bit.

23:45 |00:00 0.25|MIRU MOVE PULD P 0.00 0.00 [ Pick up and steam heat 9" drill coliar, bit sub and 311mm bit

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kg/m")

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L)

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m®)

Potassium (mg/L}

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%)

T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

1 Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field

Est (Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m®)

Cum Mud Lost to

Hole (m?3)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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COhOCOPhI“IpS

Daily Drilling
COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Report Date: 12/27/2013
Report #: 19

Depth Progress: m
Depth End: 0.00mKB

Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
-.at BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
807.00 807.00

Safety Incidents

Date Com . Category
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) 1ADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daNj)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP {m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
Drill String Components

ltem Deg-2i s 1D {mm) OD (mm) Jts Leni(m)-: Curti:Len (m)

Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) |Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..{WOB (daN) [RPM (r... {SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...!Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations : ] . : e A
Bit Hydraulic Powe..|HP/Area (kWImmz) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m? |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

A~

“*d Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

ip Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
I NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
o Date Deépthi(mKB)-- QiFlow:(mi¥min) * P.(kPa) i< : < Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
Start.Date : e “:*End Date Liner Size {mm) P Max (kPa) = Mol/Stk OR (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Gt sE i Date [.Depth'(mKB) Q Flow {m3/min) P (kPa)" : Strokes (spm)’i
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
Start Date G End:Date Liner Size (mm) 2 P:Max (kPa) : Vol/Stk OR:(m*/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
- iiDes = -=Start Date End Date Scr Sz X i Ser Sz iy 2= Note!
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500

CentrlfugeICycIone Checks

: Date Hrs:(hr) il 2 RPM(rpm) Dens OF (kg/m?) #..° Q:OF:(L/min) Déhis UF (kg/m?) LEQUE (Uminy
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200

atrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
wumber Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500

CentrlfugeICyclone Checks

: Date = Hrs.(hr) - RPM:(rpm) Dens.OF ((kg/m®*) Q-OF:{L./min). T Den$ UF (kgim% : Q UF (Lmin)
1/1 9/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




!

. .aid / Mud Additive Amounts

Conoco

SPhillips

Daily Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Canadagy

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 12/27/2013
Report #: 19

Depth Progress: m

Depth End: 0.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

“iiDes Consumed Cost . “:Size iz Units:

Gel 41.0 7.200 40.0SX
Kelzan 2.0 360:450 25.0[SX
Soda Ash 1.0 14.550 22.68 [SX
Survey Data .

Date MD (mKB) .72 5 ncl {3) Azm (%) - L TVD (mKB) Depart (m) NS (m): EW:(m) VS(m) DLS (°/30m)
Formations

: Formation Name Drili Top MD'(mKB) : Drill Top {TVD) {mKB) L Prog Top TVD (mKB). .

Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76:00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 ::938:44 7640
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 +1,658.53 1,653:40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/28/2013

A HiH Dally D""Ing Depth Progregspfgﬁgozr:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 146.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
PRV Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10.126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 0.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
73,141.63 1,639,970.34 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 40.0 470.00 19,229.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Clear . -47FNW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 7 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Conduct pre-spud inspection, fill out pre-spud and rig inspection checklists. Make up BHA, circulate and check for leaks, perform 'Hazard Hunt' and pre-spud
meetings with rig crews. Spud and drill 311mm surface hole from Om to 146m with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.
Last survey at 146m was 0.1°. Sent pre-spud Beyond Compliance, pre-spud inspection and rig inspection checklists prior to spudding. Spud and drill 311mm
surface hole at 6:30hrs on December 28, 2013.

From midnight to 6:00am: Drill 311mm surface hole to 155m. Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m.

24hr Forecast

Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m. Drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections
and circulation times. Wiper trip at 200m-+/-.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String

| Conductor, 20.00mKB

o

1e Log
o o Tim |- -~ - : i
Start ; epP- “Start Depth End-Depth e : e
Time - | End Tire |---Dur. (hr) Phése Op Cade | Activity'Code | T-X'|::Trbl. Code (mKB) {mKB)" - i e “‘Operation

00:00 |00:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 0.00 0.00 |Rig service, funtion test crown saver

00:15 |03:45 3.50|SURFAC [DRILL PULD P 0.00 0.00 | Pick up and warm up BHA, circulate check for leaks, extend
hydrualic hose for top drive

03:45 |06:30 2.75{SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 0.00 0.00 | Pre spud safety meeting and hazard hunt

06:30 |07:00 0.50 | SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 0.00 20.00 | Spud well & drill 311 mm hole Om to 20m

07:00 [08:00 1.00|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 20.00 20.00 | Crew change safety meeting & prespud meeting with second
crew :

08:00 |08:15 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 20.00 20.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

08:15 |08:30 0.251SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 20.00 20.00 | Rig service, funcction test lower crown saver

08:30 |10:30 2.00|SURFAC |WHDBOP [NUND P 20.00 20.00 | Install rubber seal in rotating head on diverter

10:30 (15:30 5.00|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 20.00 80.00 [Rotary drill 311mm hole from Om to 80 m

16:30 |[16:00 0.50[SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 80.00 80.00 | acclumlated time for surveys

16:00 [16:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 80.00 80.00 [ Rig service, function test crown saver and air horn

16:15 |18:00 1.75|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 80.00 100.00 | Rotary drill 311mm hole from 80m to 100m

18:00 |19:30 1.50 | SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 100.00 100.00 [Hole tight, circulate and condition hole at 100 m

19:30 (20:00 0.50| SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 100.00 100.00 [Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager and
Conoco reps.

20:00 (23:45 3.75|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 100.00 146.00 | Drill 311mm hole from 100m to 146m

23:45 |(00:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 146.00 146.00 | Accumulatedtime for surveys

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)

16:00 95.00 1,040.0 33 9.5 4.0 3.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m®) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
24 100 80
“actric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
( . 1,060.0 0.0 2.5 25
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface {(m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
25.0 872.10
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

1,902.75
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Report Date: 12/28/2013

C ‘6h'“' Dally D""Ing Depth Progre'::'p'?z;ﬁozrg
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 146.00mKEB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
L BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill 0 12/28/2013 3 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
808.00 808.00
Safety Incidents
Date Com " Category
Drill String: BHA # 1
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP {m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 121
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/112.7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
0.00 603.00 121 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
’ G Jteim Dés 1D (mim) 0D (mm) Jts ‘Len (m) - < Cum Len{m)
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
X/0.4" H-90 62.0 162.0 1 70}.80 138.20
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
Jar 76.0 157.0 1 473 53.40
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
Bellisub 69,0 232.0 1 0.66 20.77
9"D.C 71.0 233.0 2 18.50 20.11
Bit sub 70.0 255.0 1 0.93 +11.61
311mm BIT 72.0 311.0 1 0.34 0.68
| Drilling Parameter: 80.00 - 146.00 mKB
1Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..{WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt {(daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
146.00 11.00 12.0 2.600 10 101 9,200 33,000 33,000 33,000 33,000
Hydraulic Calculations , , g , , e i E ,
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
91.0 0.00120 23 60.0 2,099.8 18.1 1,040.0 1,052.7
Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
0.45 6.54 3.35 16.1 15.8 459 104.4
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: - Date Depth {(mKB) : P <:Q Flow-(m3/min) : Pi{kPa) i ‘. Strokes (spm).”
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
i ;- StartDate” ] e T End Date Liner Siz¢'(mm) P:Max (kPa) Vol/Stk- OR- (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 112212014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
F Date Depth {mKB) -:Q Flow (m¥min). P (kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
S Start Date’ Lo End‘Date Liner Size (mm) +P. Max (kPa) & - Vol/Stic OR (m/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
ker Screens
Des i feEdoStart Date End Date . ScriSz X% 8crSz Y Note

Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500

Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1/BOS Solutions 5500
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/28/2013

h 4 HIH Daily Dri“ing Depth Pro relsQ:P;);?ﬁozrg
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 146.00mKB
gr Canada Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2 .
.atrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i Date “Hrs {hr) RPM (rpm) Dens OF:(kg/m?) Q OF.(L/min) Dens.UF {kg/m?) Q UF{(L/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
R Date Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm) Dens.OF (kg/m®%). . Q OF.(L/min) Dens UF (kg/m®) Q UF:{L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
C B : Des  Consumed Cost Size Units
Gel 21.0 7.200 40.0|SX
Kelzan —| 2.0 :360.450 25.0|SX
Survey Data
Date MD {mKB) Incl (%) < Azm(%) TVD.(mKB) Depart (m) NS () EW:(m)- - VS (M) DLS (*/30m)
12/28/2013 29.00 0.40 0.00 29.00 0.10 0.10 0.00 0.05 0.41
12/28/2013 62.00 0.50 0.00 62.00 0.36 0.36 0.00 0.17 0.09
12/28/2013 90.00 0.20 0.00 90.00 0.53 0.53 0.00 0.26 0.32
12/28/2013 118.00 0.20 0.00 118.00 0.63 0.63 0.00 0.31 0.00
12/28/2013 147.00 0.10 0.00 147.00 0.71 0.71 0.00 0.34 0.10
12/28/2013 157.00 0.10 0.00 157.00 0.72 0.72 0.00 0.35 0.00
Formations
; e L Formation Name. :. Drill Top MD (mKB) .- Drill Top (TVD)(mKB) i Prog:Top TVD (mKB). -
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00|" 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50 938:44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
( - oer Canol j|f 1,665.00 1,658.53 1,653.40
_..wer Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

Page 3/3

Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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ConocoPhillips

Canadaw

Daily Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Report Date: 12/29/2013
Report #: 21

Depth Progress: 10.00m
Depth End: 156.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. «TUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 1.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE | RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
239,229.53 1,879,199.87 . 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00| 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD {(mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 43.0 506.00 19,735.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -43|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 7 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 311mm surface hole to 155m. Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m.

24hr Forecast

Wait on top drive parts to fix PLC issues, pump and work drill string at 155m. Fix PLC issues, drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig
services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 200m+/-.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
: ' Tim o
Start 3 : eP-|: “-Start Depth End-Depth :
Timé: | End Time |- Dur(hr). “-Phase Op'Cade Activity Codg|T-X | ..Trbl Code (mKB):. = (MKB) : ; Operation
90 |00:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 146.00 146.00 | Rig service function test crown saver
- -+.15 100:30 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 146.00 156.00 | Drill 311mm hole from 146m to 156m
00:30 [02:00 1.50 | SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 156.00 156.00 | Diverter drill, review crew positions and procedures
02:00 |07:45 5.75|SURFAC |RIGMNT RGRP T |Rig 156.00 156.00 | Circulate and move pipe, wait on top drive parts
07:45 108:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 156.00 156.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps
08:00 |08:15 0.25 |SURFAC [RIGMNT |SVRG P 156.00 156.00 |Rig Service Function Test Crown Saver
08:15 |08:30 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 1566.00 156.00 | Diverter drill, review crew positions and procedures
08:30 [16:00 7.50 [SURFAC |RIGMNT RGRP T [Rig 156.00 156.00 | Circulate, work pipe and wait on top drive parts
16:00 |[16:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 166.00 156.00 |Rig service function test crown saver
16:15 [19:00 2.75|SURFAC |RIGMNT RGRP T |Rig 166.00 156.00 | Circulate, work pipe and wait on top drive parts
19:00 [19:15 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 166.00 156.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews ,rig manager,conoco
reps
19:15 |00:00 4.75[SURFAC |RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 156.00 156.00 | Circulate, work pipe and wait on top drive parts
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson
Time Depth (mKB) Density (ka/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pass) YP Override (Pa)
16:00 95.00 1,040.0 33 9.5 4.0 3.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (ka/m®) QOil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
2.4 100 80
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
1,060.0 0.0 25 25
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
25.0
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m°) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost {Cost)
1,902.75
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... {Last Date Days Until Next... [ Next Check Date
BOP Drill 1 12/28/2013 2 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
809.00 809.00
fety Incidents
Date Com Category.
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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. — Report Date: 12/29/2013
ConocPhill Daily Drilling N
ep rog :10.
onocornmiips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 156.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. String: BHA #1
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) {(mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 121
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12.7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
0.00 603.00 121 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
: ‘ltem Des 1D {mm) 0D (mm) Jts Len (m) Cum Len {m)
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
X/0.4"H-90 62.0 162A0J 1 0.80 138.20
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
Jar : 76.0 157.0 1 4.73 53,40
6" D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
Bell:sub 69.0 232.0 1 0.66 22077
9“D.C 71.0 233.0 2 18.50 20.1
Bit sub 70:0 2550 1 0.93 21.61
311mm BIT 72.0 311.0 1 0.34 0.68
Drilling Parameter: 146.00 - 156.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) {Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
156.00 11.25 40.0 2.600 10 101 9,200 33,000 33,000 33,000 33,000
Hydraulic Calculations ) o : : Sl ; g . T e .
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) |% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [ Mud Density (kg/m® |ECD End (kg/m?)
91.0 0.00120 23 60.0 2,099.8 19.4 1,040.0 1,052.7
Drill String Volume {m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
0.49 7.10 3.42 151 15.8 459 104.4
Error
_d Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
ol : Date Depth (mKB) Q Flow {m%min) : 2 PAkPa) i L Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
B ; Start.Date . End Date Liner Size (mm) - P-Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR:(m®/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
112212014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: ; Date Depth (mMKB) = ZQ:Flow (m>/rnin) bt Pi{kPa). =i o b Strokes (spm):
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
Start Date L “.:End Date Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR (m¥/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
M Deés . Start Date End Date -8erSz X ScrSz Y- = Note %
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
= i " “Date Hrs:{(hr) RPM (rpm) Déns OF (kg/m®) QOF(L/min) 20 “-Dens UF{kg/m®) Q UR (Lmin =
9/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 ) 0.200
“T<entrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2| BOS Solutions 5500
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/29/2013

C hill Daily Drilling bepth Progi o 21
p ess: 10.
onocor niltps COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 156.00mKE
) Canada s . Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
-. _«trifuge/Cyclone Checks
Date Hrs (hr) ‘RPM.{rpm) »:Dens OF (kg/m?) Q OF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m?) Q UF (Lmin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
! : - : Des Consumed : Cost Size Units
Survey Data
Date MD.(mKB)-* Incl (®) AZm {°) TVD (mKB) Depart (m) NS (m) EW (mi) VSi{m) : DLS:(°/30m)
Formations
Lo Formation Name Drill Top MD (mKB) Drill Top (TVD) (mKB) . "'Prog Top“TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76:00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House [ 938.50 +17:938.44 . 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 ; 1,658.53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/30/2013
Report #: 22

h HIH Dally D""lng Depth Progress: 56.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 212.00mKB
B Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
{ Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 2.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
84,792.19 1,963,992.06 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00[10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 46.0 552.00 20,287.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -47|NE 10 kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Wiper trip at 212m. Last survey at 211m was 0.3°. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 5 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Wait on top drive parts to fix HPU issues, pump and work drill string at 155m. Fix HPU issues. Drill 311mm surface hole from 155m to 212m with accumulated
wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 212m. Last survey at 211m was 0.3°.

24hr Forecast

Drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 400m+/-.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log

(

stat | : : : u :lT—, Start Depth - |+ End Depth
| - Time_ [ End Time | - Dur (hr) Phasé ‘Op Code Activity Code| T:X |  Trbl. Code (mKB) (mKB) GL e Operation \
0 [00:15 0.25 |SURFAC |[RIGMNT |SVRG P 166.00 156.00 | Rig Service function test crown saver
. .15 |07:45 7.50 |SURFAC |RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 166.00 156.00 | Circulate and work pipe wait on Top Drive parts
07:45 |08:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 166.00 156.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps
08:00 |08:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 156.00 166.00 | Rig service function test crown saver
08:15 [14:15 6.00 |SURFAC |RIGMNT |RGRP T [Rig 156.00 156.00 | Circulate and work pipe wait on top drive mechanic
14:15 |[15:45 1.50 |SURFAC |RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 156.00 156.00 | Down time - top drive repair HPU with wajax mechanical.
15:45 (16:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 156.00 156.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps
16:00 [16:15 0.25 |SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 156.00 156.00 | Rig service function test crown saver operating properly
16:15 [17:00 0.75|SURFAC |RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 166.00 156.00 | Down time - top drive repair HPU with wajax mechanical.
17:00 (18:15 1.25|SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 166.00 156.00 | Circulate top drive to warm up system
18:15 |21:15 3.00|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 166.00 212.00 |Rotary drill 311mm surface hole from 1566mKB to 212m
21:15 |21:30 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 212.00 212.00 [ Circulate hole clean to wiper trip
21:30 |21:45 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 212.00 212.00 |Wire line survey at 211m, 0.3 deg.
21:45 |22:15 0.50 {SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 212.00 212.00 | Wiper trip out of hole to 194m
22:15 |23:00 0.75|SURFAC |DRILL TRIP P 212.00 212.00 |work tight hole @193m circ and work string
23:.00 |23:15 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 212.00 212.00 |Crew hand over safety meeting
23:15 |00:00 0.75|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 212.00 212.00 | Wiper trip out of hole
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)
16:00 95.00 1,040.0 33 9.5 4.0 3.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
2.4 100 80
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate {mL/30...
1,060.0 0.0 2.5 25
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
25.0 72.00
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Gumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
1,974.75
..ot BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... | Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 2 12/28/2013 1 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident {(days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
810.00 810.00
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014
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ConocoPhillips
Canada ¥

Daily Drilling

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Report Date: 12/30/2013

Dept

Report #: 22
h Progress: 56.00m

Depth End: 212.00mKB

Rig Rele:

ase Date: 1/23/2014

_ ..ety Incidents

i Date i Com Category
Drill String: BHA # 1
Bit Run | Drill Bit Length (m) 1ADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 12.1
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12.7 603.00 311.0 55,000

Depth In (mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

!

0.00 603.00 121 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
- ltem Des D, (mim) : * ;0D (mm) Jis . Len(m) . - .Cum Len (m)
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
X0 4" H-90 62.0 162.0 1 +20:80 138:20
6" D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
Jar 76.0 157.0 A1 4T3 53.40
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
Bell subk 69.0 232.0 1 0.66 20.77.
9"D.C 71.0 233.0 2 18.50 20.11
Bit sub ’ 70.0 255.0 g 0:93 161
311mm BIT 72.0 311.0 1 0.34 0.68
Drilling Parameter: 156.00 - 212.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) [RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
212.00 14.25 18.7 2.600 9,000 120 9,000 39,000 38,000 40,000 39,000 4,420.0
Hydraulic Calculations e s } : T - R - ;
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)
91.0 0.00120 23 60.0 2,099.8 25.3 1,040.0 1,052.2
String Volume {m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?®) {Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min)} |Max Casing AV (m/min) |[Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
. 0.70 10.58 3.43 15.1 15.1 41.7 104.4
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
4 ; : Date Depth (mKB) = Q Flow:(m*min) .. : P.(kPa) E Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
Start Date End Date Linef:Size (mm) : oP Max (kKPa) o = Vol/StKOR (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm}) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
= Date Depth(mKB) Q Flow (m?¥/min) 2 P (kPa) : Strokes:(spm)”
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
: - StartDate ' " : End.Date’ Liner Size"(mm) P-Max (kPa)” : - : #2VolfStk OR (m¥/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
i Des Start Date End Date ScrSziX: il ScrSz:Y Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
1ber Make Model Diameter (mm)
. 1| BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
e Date “Hrs (hn) RPM (rpm) Dens OF (kg/m?) Q OF (L/min) Dens UF{kg/m?*). .- Q UF (L/min) -
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/30/2013

5P itli Daily Dri"ing Depth Pro rzzgf):e%oﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 212.00mKEB
anada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

- witrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make

2|BOS Solutions

Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks

Model Diameter (mm)

5500

Date Hrs hr) RPM {rpm) Dens OF:(kg/m?) Q OF (Liiin) Dens UF (kgim?)- Q UF (L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
T ! Des. Consumed Cost Size Units
Gel 10.0 7.200 40.0|SX
Survey Data
Date MD(mKB) incl () Azm (%) TVD (mKB) Deépait () NS (m) EW:(m) "1 ENS(m) DLS (°/30m)
12/30/2013 183.00 0.20 0.00 183.00 0.79 0.79 0.00 0.38 0.12
12/30/2013 211.00 0.30 0.00 211.00 0.91 0.91 0.00 0.44 0.11
Formations
i - Formation Name ~Drill Top:MD (mKB) Drill Top (TVD) (MKB) "= Prog Top TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin‘House 938.50 938.44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665:00 1,658.53 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page

313

Report Printed: 4/10/2014




Report Date: 12/31/2013

b Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progregg!):gtigozr:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 396.00mKB
Canada Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
(” ) Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
JUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOBO1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation {(m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 3.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
95,875.06 2,059,867.12 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00|10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 47.0 554.00 20,841.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Clear -43|SW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
|Wiper trip from 396m at 173m. Last survey at 378m was 0.4°. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 4 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Wiper trip at 212m, wash through tight spots at 183m and 136m. Drill 311mm surface hole from 212m to 396m with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services,
connections and circulation times. Wiper frip at 396m. Last survey at 378m was 0.4°.

24hr Forecast

Drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 590 m+/- (strap out).

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String

Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
: [ Tim :
Start - | R Ry - G| BPs ‘Start Depth. |- -“End Depth . T I
i Time: - |\End:Time | Dur,(hr)-|. i cPhase Op:Code Activity Code | F=X:| = Trbl Code | i i (mKB)= = {mKB) Rk - s - Operation T :
00:00 ]03:30 3.50 [SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 212.00 212.00 |Wiper trip into conductor, back ream from 196m to 58m
( 20 |03:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 212.00 212.00 | Rig service, function test crown saver

vu45 [04:30 0.75|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 212.00 212.00 | Pull out to 9" collars, remove 6 " rotating head rubber

04:30 06:00 1.50 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 212.00 212.00 | Trip in hole to 4" HWDP

06:00 |06:45 0.75 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT ([P 212.00 212.00 |Install 4" rubber in rotating head

06:45 |(07:45 1.00 |[SURFAC [DRILL WASH [P 212.00 212.00 |Wash to bottom from 88m

07:45 |08:00 0.25 [SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 212.00 212.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

08:00 |(08:30 0.50 [SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 212.00 230.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 212m to 230m

08:30 [08:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 230.00 230.00 | Rig service function test rig smart function test crown saver
grease all moving parts check engine fluid levels

08:45 [14:30 5.75|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 230.00 330.00 |Rotary drill 311 hole from 230m to 330m

14:30 (16:00 1.50 |SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 330.00 330.00 [ Conections and surveys

16:00 |17:00 1.00 |SURFAC |[DRILL DRLG P 330.00 340.00 | Rotary drill 31tmm hole from 330m to 340m

17:00 |17:15 0.25 |SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 340.00 340.00 | Rig service crown saver operating properly

17:15 |19:00 1.75 [SURFAC [DRILL DRLG P 340.00 368.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 340m to 368 m

19:00 |19:15 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 368.00 368.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

19:15 (22:00 2.75|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 368.00 396.00 |Rotary drill 311 mm hole from 368 m to 396m

22:00 22:30 0.50 |SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 396.00 396.00 |Acclumlated time for surveys

22:30 |23:00 0.50 |[SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 396.00 396.00 | Circ & condition hole

23:00 |(00:00 1.00 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 396.00 396.00 | Trip out of hole, back ream from 396 m to 359 m

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pass) YP Override (Pa)

14:30 331.00 1,040.0 40 8.0 11.0 3.5

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

8.7 2,000 160

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

1,164.0 0.0 8.8 35
" Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
13.0 480.53
Gum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

2,455.28
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Report Date: 12/31/2013
Report #: 23

C hil Daily Drilling Ceoth p ort #: 22
) ep rogress: .
Oonocorhiliips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 396.00mKEB
Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
] Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
( .t BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 3 12/28/2013 0 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
811.00 811.00
Safety Incidents
Date Com Category
_ Drill String: BHA # 1
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) JADC Bit Dull TFA (inc! Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 12.1
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12.7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
0.00 603.00 121 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
P R R o temiDest T i ID.{mmim). QDi(mm). RN 1 e :Leni{(m) «cumilen{m) i
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
X/O 42 H-90: - 62.0 162:.0 oo s & 0480 138:20
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
NETR =760 157:0 1 473 533'.40
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
Bell sgb 69:0 . 232.0 1 066 20.77
9"D.C 71.0 233.0 | 2 18.50 2011
Bit fsub; - < 70.0 255:0 - 1 0.93 1161
311mm BIT 72.0 311.0 1 0.34 0.68
Drilling Parameter: 330.00 - 396.00 mKB
v Depth (m) {Cum Drill... {Int ROP (... {Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
! 396.00 26.00 12.0 2.600 12,000 120 13,000 49,000 47,000 51,000 49,000 8,000.0
Hydraulic:Calculations .o S ’ s e SRR et il
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m?®) {ECD End (kg/m?)
91.0 0.00120 16 60.0 2,099.8 36.8 1,040.0 1,049.5
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
1.41 22.03 3.43 15.1 16.1 41.7 104.4
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length {mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
e : Date: Depth:(mKB) : Q:Flow:(m>/min) P.(kPa): Strokes:{spm).:
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
L = - Start Date: o s g EndiDate Liner.Size {mm) P.Max:(kPa): - VolfStkiOR-(m*/stk) -
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
s B Goile ! Date :Dépth (MKB): B Q Flow:{r*min) = P:(kPs). . i Strokes {spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
Hiea Start Date’ AR EndDate Liner Sizé (mpm):iit e P:Max:(kPa)::: Gy Vol/Stk OR:(m2/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
ker Screens
: - Desi Start Date:* End Date Ser-Sz X Scr:Sz. Y Note:
Centrifuge/Cycione: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1| BOS Solutions 5500
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Report Date: 12/31/2013

hc HIH Dally D”"Ing Depth Pro rez‘saP'?;:ﬁoﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Sopth o 566.00mKE
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
_itrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: ;Daté: “zHrs (ht) RPM:(rpm): i sssifs Bens:OF (kgim?) Q OF (L/min)- Dens UF:{(kg/m®) QUE:(Lmin):::
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
‘ Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
L Date Hrs.(hr). . ' RPM:{rpm) Dens OF (kg/m?) : Q-OF:{L/min) “Dens:UF:(kg/m?) Q:UF (Limin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
: i DS Consumed:- Cost e : Size: Unltssis
Caustic - 1.0 ﬂﬁ" 50.0|SX
FEDPACR 1.0 190:000 22:68:SX.;
Gel 30 7.200 20.0[SX
[Sawdust 20.0] 2.980 i D
SOAP STICKS 12.0 15.390 | ﬁ}ﬁCK
Survey Data
s Date MD,(mKB):=: Inel{°) SAZmi(%) TVD (MKB) . Departi{m) 3 EW:{(m) VS:(m) BLS (°/30m). <
12/31/2013 240.00 0.50 0.00 240.00 1.12 1.12 0.00 0.54 0.21
12/31/2013 269.00 0.80 0.00 268.99 1.44 1.44 0.00 0.70 0.31
12/31/2013 306.00 1.00 0.00 305.99 2.03 2.03 0.00 0.98 0.16
12/31/2013 348.00 0.90 0.00 347.98 2.72 2.72 0.00 1.32 0.07
12/31/2013 378.00 0.40 0.00 377.98 3.06 3.06 0.00 1.49 0.50
Formations
S < Formation.Name Drill Top:-MD{mKB) il Top{TVR)(mKB): Prog Top TVD {mKB) ;
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater Ri\(er 76.00 76:00:| 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
( tin:House v -938.50 938.44.| 76.40
_werial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol:: - : +1,665.00 1,658.53 1:653:40
Lower Canol _I_ 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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